
 
 
 

1. Maharajpura Village Visit under Unnat Bharat Abhiyan (UBA) 

Maharajpura Village Visit under Unnat Bharat Abhiyan (UBA) was organized by the Amity University 
Madhya Pradesh on 6thAugust, 2021.Unnat Bharat Abhiyan (UBA) is a flagship programme of Ministry of 
Human Resource Development (MHRD), Govt. of India. Amity University Madhya Pradesh is 
participating in UBA and adopted five villages (1. Maharajpura 2. Girvai 3. Mohanpur 4. Gangapur   5. 
Behata) for their development in collaboration of district administration. Funds (Rs. 50,000/-) have been 
received from MHRD, Govt of India to carry out the various surveys and activities in five identified 
villages. Rs 10,000/- per village is earmarked to carry out the survey. Amity University Madhya Pradesh, 
UBA cell organized first village survey at Maharajpura village Gwalior (M.P.) and conducted different 
social activities such as Plantation, Covid – 19 awareness program, Mask Distribution and Water 
Management etc. on 6/8/2021.Total 8 Faculty members and 8 students from different institutions such 
as ASCO, AIP, AIB and ASET participated in the village survey activities. 2 village survey form and 20 
household survey form filled by the villagers to find out the basic problems of villagers. The brief 
introduction about the UBA was given by Dr. Vivek Singh Kushwah, Coordinator, UBA, AUMP and a 
lecture on Covid-19 awareness program to the villagers was delivered by Dr Deepak Motwani, Co-
Coordinator, UBA, AUMP and Dr Pranav Mishra, Assistant Professor, ASCO. Hon’ble VC Lt. Gen. V.K. 
Sharma and Maj Gen (Dr) SC Jain, VSM** (Retd) Director, Amity School of Engineering & Technology 
Congratulated Committee members of UBA Cell AUMP on successful completion of survey. He wished 
luck to take the project on next level for welfare of society.  
 

 

  



  

  

2. Covid Vaccination Awareness Campaign (2021) in Maharajpura Village  

Maharajpura Village Visit under Covid Vaccination Awareness Campaign was organized by the Amity 
School of Engineering and Technology (ASET) on 6thAugust, 2021 in order to create awareness amongst 
the rural mass of India about the various measures to stop the spread of Covid-19, significance of 
wearing mask and vaccination. The event was conducted under the able guidance of Maj Gen (Dr) SC 
Jain, VSM** (Retd), Director (ASET) who was also present during the event. Dr. Vivek Singh Kushwah, Dr. 
Deepak Motwani, Mr. Ramesh Kumar Ojha and Mr. Amit Gosai from ASET have participated in the ibid 
event. Faculties and staff from AIP, AIB and ASCO departments as well as the students from various 
institutes of AUMP have also participated in the event. The people were made aware about the 
importance of wearing mask and were also distributed with the masks of good quality. A short speech 
was also delivered to the people about the significance of vaccination and the process of taking vaccine. 
The people were highly satisfied by the efforts made by our team and were also convinced to take 
vaccine at their respective turns. All the involved faculties, staff and students have shown a great 
enthusiasm in the entire event and have participated dynamically in all the activities under the ibid 
event. Hon’ble Vice Chancellor Lt. Gen. V.K. Sharma, AVSM (Retd) and Maj Gen (Dr) SC Jain, VSM** 
(Retd) Director, ASET have congratulated the entire team of Covid Vaccination Awareness Campaign on 
successful completion of the event.  
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