
Company Name HINDUSTAN COCA- COLA BEVERAGES LTD

Registration Period Start Date 2023-04-25

Registration Period End Date 2023-04-26

About Company

The Coca-Cola Company (NYSE: KO) is a total beverage
company, offering over 500 brands in more than 200
countries and territories. In addition to the company’s
Coca-Cola brands, their portfolio includes some of the
world’s most valuable beverage brands, such as AdeS
soy-based beverages, Ayataka green tea, Dasani waters,
Del Valle juices and nectars, Fanta, Georgia coffee, Gold
Peak teas and coffees, Honest Tea, innocent smoothies
and juices, Minute Maid juices, Powerade sports drinks,
Simply ju

Website https://www.coca-colacompany.com/

Date Of Campus 2023-05-01

Venue Virtual

Joining 2023-05-10

Job Title Executive Trainee

Employment Type Full Time

Eligible Degree

Eligible Branches MBA- HR

Eligible Criteria 60% tThroughout

Roles & Responsibility

Need to drive Frontend Productivity & support for increase
in Sales efficiencies through driving Manpower
productivity. Need to drive Manning norms for all frontend
associates. Implementation & Execution of Standardized
HR processes, communication, people capability building,
policy implementation. Market Developer Management to
create stability in the Field Force Talent: Drive business



 

metrics through application of ABC Model of Talent
Management in partnership viz support for Assessment C

Service Aggrement, If Any NA

Other Skill
Should be a quick learner Should be ready to take new
challenges Should be ready to take additional
responsibilities Should be a street smarter

Package 6.00 LPA

Location Bangalore

Recruitment Process
1. Pre Placement Talk 2. Online Test 3. Group Discussion
4. Personal Interview

How to Apply
Login to Amizone and go to the respective company then
click on "Apply" button to register.

Represntative from ATPC(For any
Guidance/ Query)

Swati Chawla ( schawla94@amity.edu)

[Click Here To Apply]

Best Wishes

Anjani Kumar Bhatnagar

Amity Technical Placement Centre

Room # G - 02, E-2 Ground Floor

Amity University Campus, Sector - 125, Noida,  UP - 201313

Tel: 0120 4392183 | Email Id: ajbhatnagar@amity.edu | Website : www.amity.edu / placement  

https://student.amizone.net

