
Company Name Hexaware Technologies

Registration Period Start Date 2022-09-13

Registration Period End Date 2022-09-14

About Company

Hexaware is a fast-growing and automation-led next-
generation provider, with a deep-rooted legacy of
delivering excellence in IT, BPO and Consulting services
and with a rapidly expanding international footprint. This
superior performance is driven by a combination of
superior strategy, best teams in the world and a culture
that is passionate about innovation and automation.

Website www.hexaware.com

Date Of Campus 2022-09-19

Venue Virtual

Joining 2023-01-13

Job Title Premier Graduate Engineer Trainee

Employment Type Full Time

Eligible Degree

Eligible Branches B.Tech (CS/IT/ECE/EEE/ETC/EIE/ICE)

Eligible Criteria 60% or 6 CGPA throughout 10th to highest degree.

Roles & Responsibility

To work on growing technology concepts in full stack
programming • To be part of growing digital company in
the space of Cloudify, Automation and Transform customer
experience • Opportunity to work with varied client
accounts and projects thus enabling in enhancement of
skills and attributes. • As a member of our technology
teams, you should be passionate around solving business
problems through innovation and engineering practices. •
Gain deep knowledge in programming languages, program
design



 
Amity Technical Placement Centre 
Room # G - 02, E-2 Ground Floor, Amity University Campus, Sector - 125, Noida,  UP - 201313 
Tel: 0120 4392183 | Email Id: ajbhatnagar@amity.edu | Website : www.amity.edu/placement  

Service Aggrement, If Any 2 Years’ Service Agreement

Other Skill

Excellent written, verbal, and interpersonal skills.
Proficiency in MS Office. Superb attention to detail. A
positive attitude and willingness to learn. Excellent time
management skills

Package
6,00,000 Per Annum, (Stipend – 25000 INR for training
period of 3 Months)

Location
Chennai, Pune, or Mumbai (Location shall be decided
basis business requirement)

Recruitment Process PPT. Online Test. Interviews

How to Apply
Login to Amizone and go to the respective company in the
placement tab and click on the “Apply” button to register.

Represntative from ATPC(For any
Guidance/ Query)

Ms Smita Gupta (sgupta13@amity.edu)

[Click Here To Apply]

https://student.amizone.net
mailto:ajbhatnagar@amity.edu
http://www.amity.edu/placement

